
CABLING

VENDOR AT & T CALENCE INX INC

ADVANCED 
COMMUNICATIONS & 

CABLING

NETSYNC 
NETWORK 

SOLUTIONS

CABLING
LEVITON / 
SUPERIOR

LEVITON / 
SUPERIOR

LEVITON / 
SUPERIOR LEVITON / SUPERIOR LEVITON / SUPERIOR

UHS $1,174,686.88 $1,297,750.90 $1,461,710.31 NO BID NO BID
USHS $934,424.89 $937,686.13 $1,076,101.61 NO BID NO BID
LOMS $363,963.00 $419,301.81 $494,691.99 NO BID NO BID
GARCIA MS $364,996.91 $419,301.81 $494,691.99 NO BID NO BID
USMS $369,028.02 $407,010.07 $494,691.99 NO BID NO BID
WMS $364,996.91 $419,301.81 $494,691.99 NO BID NO BID
CLARK $314,002.34 $282,661.46 $371,553.56 NO BID NO BID
KENNEDY ZAPATA 
ELEM $309,275.76 $281,279.95 $371,553.56 NO BID NO BID
PEREZ ELEM $309,803.04 $287,113.38 $371,553.56 NO BID NO BID
ROOSEVELT ELEM $310,637.66 $281,316.31 $371,553.56 NO BID NO BID
SALINAS ELEM $288,557.06 $279,947.76 $371,553.56 NO BID NO BID
TOTAL $5,104,372.47 $5,312,671.39 $6,374,347.68 NO BID NO BID

UNITED INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT
NETWORK EQUIPMENT & DATA CABLING E RATE 11

RFP 069-2007



ACCESS POINTS, NETWORK EQUIPMENT & UPS

VENDOR AT & T CALENCE INX INC

ADVANCED 
COMMUNICATIO
NS & CABLING

NETSYNC NETWORK 
SOLUTIONS

UHS* $102,784.49 $94,746.78 $111,794.60 NO BID $92,407.20
USHS $886,203.93 $835,335.73 $845,084.79 NO BID $790,547.75
LOMS $455,565.12 $428,329.63 $470,309.33 NO BID $424,778.55
GARCIA MS $455,565.12 $429,309.28 $470,309.33 NO BID $424,778.55
USMS $455,565.12 $429,309.28 $470,309.33 NO BID $424,778.55
WMS $455,565.12 $429,309.28 $470,309.33 NO BID $424,778.55
CLARK $346,037.26 $327,948.88 $341,689.72 NO BID $327,396.50
KENNEDY ZAPATA 
ELEM $346,037.26 $327,948.88 $341,689.72 NO BID $327,396.50
PEREZ ELEM $346,037.26 $327,948.88 $341,689.72 NO BID $327,396.50
ROOSEVELT ELEM $346,037.26 $327,948.88 $341,689.72 NO BID $327,396.50
SALINAS ELEM $346,037.26 $327,948.88 $341,689.72 NO BID $327,396.50
GONZALEZ MS $462,790.67 $429,309.28 $464,519.41 NO BID $428,848.55
L.BRUNI MS $462,790.67 $429,309.28 $464,519.41 NO BID $428,848.55
ZAFFIRINI ELEM $351,570.91 $327,948.88 $339,687.72 NO BID $330,396.50
TOTAL $5,818,587.45 $5,472,651.82 $5,815,291.85 NO BID $5,407,145.25

*ACCESS PTS & UPS ONLY

UNITED INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT
NETWORK EQUIPMENT & DATA CABLING E RATE 11

RFP 069-2007



VIDEO STREAMING

UHS NO BID $46,813.10 NO BID $59,070.08 NO BID
USHS NO BID $136,854.23 NO BID $424,321.92 NO BID
LOMS NO BID $46,813.10 NO BID $59,070.08 NO BID
GARCIA MS NO BID $46,813.10 NO BID $59,070.08 NO BID
USMS NO BID $46,813.10 NO BID $59,025.08 NO BID
WMS NO BID $46,813.10 NO BID $59,025.08 NO BID
CLARK NO BID $46,813.10 NO BID $59,025.08 NO BID
KENNEDY ZAPATA ELEM NO BID $46,813.09 NO BID $59,025.08 NO BID
PEREZ ELEM NO BID $46,813.09 NO BID $59,025.08 NO BID
ROOSEVELT ELEM NO BID $46,813.09 NO BID $59,025.08 NO BID
SALINAS ELEM NO BID $46,813.09 NO BID $59,025.08 NO BID
TOTAL NO BID $604,985.19 NO BID $1,014,707.72 NO BID

UNITED INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT
NETWORK EQUIPMENT & DATA CABLING E RATE 11

RFP 069-2007

ADVANCED 
COMMUNICATIONS 

& CABLING

NETSYNC 
NETWORK 

SOLUTIONSVENDOR AT & T CALENCE INX INC



NETWORK SMARTNET MAINTENANCE

VENDOR AT & T CALENCE INX INC

NETSYNC 
NETWORK 

SOLUTIONS
SMARTNET 
MAINTENANCE $785,737.54 $775,394.40 $849,759.55 $724,416.64

UNITED INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT
NETWORK EQUIPMENT & DATA CABLING E RATE 11

RFP 069-2007



 ISP CIRCUITS

VENDOR
INTERNET SERVICE
1 GIG TRANSPORT INTERNET ACCESS
1 YEAR CONTRACT
3 YEAR CONTRACT

200 MBPS $16,185.11/MTH
400 MBPS $28,024.00/MTH
600 MBPS $36,514.00/MTH
800 MBPS $45,004.00/MTH
1 GBPS $53,890.00/MTH

NO BID

AT & T

5 YEAR CONTRACT

UNITED INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT
NETWORK EQUIPMENT & DATA CABLING E RATE 11

RFP 069-2007

NO BID


